
 

City of Azle 
Regular Meeting Agenda 

City Council 

505 W. Main Street 
Azle, Texas 76020 

 
 

March 17, 2026 
 

 
6:00 PM  

 
Council Chambers  

 
Pursuant to Section 551.071 of the Texas Government Code, the Council may convene into Executive Session(s) from time to time as deemed 
necessary during the meeting for any posted agenda item and may receive advice from its attorney as permitted by law.  

CALL TO ORDER 

INVOCATION   
The City of Azle is accepting volunteers from all Religions and Denominations to provide the invocation at the beginning of the City Council meeting.  If 
you are interested in giving the invocation at a future meeting, please call the city secretary’s office at 817-444-7101 or email:  yhoffman@cityofazle.org 
Brenda Tatsak -Assistant Director, Good N.E.W.S.  

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

PUBLIC PARTICIPATION  
This is an opportunity for the public to address the City Council on posted agenda items or non-agenda items. In order to address the Council, please 
complete a Speaker’s Request Form and submit to the City Secretary prior to the start of the council meeting. All comments must be directed to the 
Presiding Officer, rather than an individual council member or city staff. All speakers must refrain from personal attacks toward any individual. 
Comments are limited to three (3) minutes and must pertain to the subject matter listed on the Speaker’s Request Form. Speakers requiring the 
assistance of a translator shall be provided four (4) minutes. Council may not comment publicly on non-agenda items, but may direct the City Manager 
to resolve the matter or request the matter be placed on a future agenda. Public comments regarding non-agenda items shall not include any 
“deliberation” as defined by Chapter 551 of the Government Code, as now or hereafter amended. If you have a subject that may require City Council 
action, you may obtain a form from the City Secretary and request the item be placed on a future agenda. 

PRESENTATION 

1. Finance Department Annual Report 
 Stephen Barnes, Finance Director 

ACTION ITEMS 

2. Consider any action on the March 3, 2026, regular council meeting minutes. 
 Yael Hoffman, City Secretary 
3. Consider any action awarding the bid for the City's annual requirement of Process Chemicals 

(Bid No. 2026-002) 
 Jennifer Walls, Purchasing Agent 
4. Consider any action on the Facade and Signage Improvement Program application for 1129 - 

1137 SE Pkwy 
 Kristen Pegues, Community & Marketing Specialist 
5. Consider a petition for release from the City's Extraterritorial Jurisdiction (ETJ) for property legally 

described as a 6.88-acre tract of land situated in the Sarah Ann Dodson Survey, Abstract No. 
363, Parker County, Texas, being described as 1.0 acres identified as Property ID R000039654 
and Geographic ID 20363.008.000.00 and 5.88 acres identified as Property ID R000097501 and 
Geographic ID 20363.007.003.00 in the records of Parker County, Texas, a portion of all of that 
tract of land described by deed to Weatherby Business Park II, LLC, recorded in Document No. 
202533599, County Records, Parker County, Texas and addressed as 13103 S FM 730. 

 David Hawkins, Director of Planning and Development 
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6. Consider any action on Ordinance No. 2026-07 Sex Offender Residency Restrictions, to prohibit 
certain registered sex offenders from residing within a certain distance of where children 
commonly gather 

 Ben Hall, Police Chief 

ITEMS TO BE PLACED ON FUTURE MEETING AGENDAS 

MAYOR/COUNCIL COMMENTS OF COMMUNITY INTEREST 

EXECUTIVE SESSION 

• 551.071 CONSULTATION WITH THE CITY ATTORNEY 

• The City Council may conduct a private consultation with its attorney when the City 
Council seeks the advice of its attorney concerning any item on this agenda, about 
pending and contemplated litigation, or a settlement offer, or on a matter in which the duty 
of the attorney to the City Council under the Texas Disciplinary Rules of Professional 
Conduct of the State Board of Texas clearly conflicts with Chapter 551. 

     U.S Realty 87 Azle Associates, LP vs. City of Azle. 
  

• 551.074 PERSONNEL MATTERS 

• Deliberate the appointment, employment, evaluation, reassignment, duties, discipline, or 
dismissal of City Manager. 

 
  
7. Consider any action pursuant to Executive Session.  
 

 

ADJOURNMENT 

  

 
I, the undersigned authority, do hereby certify the above Agenda was posted at City Hall on 03-11-2026, at the 
City’s official bulletin board and is readily accessible to the public at all times in accordance with V.T.C.A. 
Chapter 551, Texas Government Code. 

   
Yael Hoffman, TRMC, MMC 
City Secretary 
This facility is wheelchair accessible and handicapped parking spaces are available.  Auxiliary aids and services are available to a person when 
necessary to afford an equal opportunity to participate in city functions and activities.  Auxiliary aids and services or accommodations should be 
requested forty-eight hours prior to the scheduled starting time by calling the City Secretary’s Office at 817-444-7101. Complete City Council agenda 
packet is available for review at the City Secretary’s Office and on our website www.cityofazle.org. 
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Item Number: 1  

  

Presenter: Stephen Barnes, Finance Director 
Agenda Item: Finance Department Annual Report 

 
Background and Explanation: 
Finance Department Annual Report 

Board/Commission/Committee Recommendation: 
 

Staff Recommendation: 
 

Attachments: 
1. Finance Department FY 2025 Annual Presentation 
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City of Azle
Finance Department 

Annual Update
FY 2024-2025
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Finance Department 

Metric 2025 2024

General Fund Balance Percentage of Total Expenditures 59% 64%

Investment earnings yield 4.21% 4.86%

AP invoices paid 8,713 8,064

Purchase Orders issued 362 396

Number of Utility Service Orders processed 4,910 5,136
Total number of water accounts 6,605 6,402
Total number of sewer accounts 5,834 5,585
Total number of garbage accounts 5,498 5,399
Number of violations 5,462 3,997
Number of cases disposed from Teen Court/SWEAT 66 67
Number of court payments processed 7,767 6,913
Number of Warrants issued 1,534 2,829 Page 6 of 56



Finance Department - Accomplishments

Completion of City’s Annual Audit- FY2025
▪ Unqualified Opinion – Best Audit Opinion 

Compliance with Public Funds Investment Act
▪ Investment policy
▪ Investment Quarterly Report
▪ $50,502,720 investment portfolio as of September 30, 2025
▪ Increased 10%
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Finance Department- Awards

GFOA Certificate of 
Achievement for Excellence 

in Financial Reporting

▪ 2024 Annual 
Comprehensive Financial 
Report

▪ 23rd Consecutive Year

GFOA Popular Annual 
Financial Reporting Award

▪ 2024 Fiscal Year

▪ 10th Consecutive Year
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Finance Department- Awards

2025 Annual Budget
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Presentation 

Award
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Finance Department

National Night Out 
Participation 

2025 Earth Day 
Clean-up / 

Citywide Clean Up 
Participation
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Participation – 

Community 
Engagement
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Questions/Comments
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Item Number: 2  

  

Presenter: Yael Hoffman, City Secretary 
Agenda Item: Consider any action on the March 3, 2026, regular council meeting minutes. 

 
Background and Explanation: 
 

Board/Commission/Committee Recommendation: 
 

Staff Recommendation: 
 

Attachments: 
1. 03-03-2026 Minutes 
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Page 1 of 5 

MINUTES 
Regular Meeting 
Azle City Council 

505 W. Main Street 
Azle, Texas 76020 

March 3, 2026 6:00 PM  Council Chambers  

CALL TO ORDER    
Mayor Goode called the meeting to order at 6:00 PM. 
Members Present:  
Mayor Randa Goode 
Mayor Pro-tem Stacy Peek 
Councilmember Derrick Nelson 
Councilmember Amy Estes 
Councilmember Josh Berry 
Councilmember Rouel Rothenberger 
Councilmember Brian Conner 
Staff Present:  
Tom Muir 
Yael Hoffman 
Andrea Russell 
Susie Hiles 
Will Scott 
Lee Godbold 
Ben Hall 
Kevin Rogers 
Stephen Barnes 
Curren McLane 
Victor Gonzales 
David Hawkins 
Amanda Scott 
Kristen Pegues 

City Manager 
City Secretary 
City Attorney 
Assistant to the City Manager 
Fire Chief 
Assistant Fire Chief 
Police Chief 
Police Lieutenant 
Finance Director 
Library Director 
Assistant Library Director 
Director of Planning and Development 
Special Events Coordinator 
Community and Marketing Specialist 

 INVOCATION   
Rev. Josh Tollison — Senior Pastor, Lighthouse Harbor Church, gave the invocation. 

 PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE   
Mayor Goode led the Pledge of Allegiance. 

 PUBLIC PARTICIPATION  
See agenda item No. 5. 

 PRESENTATIONS  

1. Azle Senior Center Update
Mayor Goode recognized Special Events Coordinator Amanda Scott, who gave a short review of the

Page 13 of 56



 

Page 2 of 5 

activities at the Senior Center. 

2. FY 2026 1st Quarter Investment Report 
 Mayor Goode recognized Finance Director Stephen Barnes, who gave a short summary on the 

Quarterly Report ending December 31, 2025. The average quarterly yield was 3.74% with quarterly 
interest earnings of $485,972. 

3. Hornets Wrestling Team 
 Mayor Goode honored the Azle ISD Hornets Wrestling Teams and commended them on their 

achievements at the state level, with the girls’ team being named State Champions and the boys’ team 
finishing as State Runners-Up.  Mayor Goode presented each team with a plaque of appreciation from 
the City of Azle. 

ACTION ITEMS     

4. Consider any action on the 02-17-2026 regular council meeting minutes, 02-23-2026, and 02-24-
2026 Strategic Planning meetings. 

 Councilmember Rothenberger moved to approve the minutes of the 02-17-2026 regular council 
meeting and the 02-23-2026 and 02-24-2026 Strategic Planning meetings, as presented. 
Councilmember Conner seconded the motion.  
Yes: (7) Randa Goode, Stacy Peek, Derrick Nelson, Amy Estes, Josh Berry, Rouel 

Rothenberger, Brian Conner 

5. Consider any action of Resolution 2026-04 authorizing the City's participation in the U.S. 
Immigration and Customs Enforcement (ICE) 287(g) Task Force Model Program and authorizing 
the City Manager to execute the memorandum of agreement (MOA) and all necessary 
documents. 

 Mayor Goode recognized Police Chief Hall, who provided an overview of the Azle Police Department's 
proposed participation in the ICE 287(g) program. He noted the program allows limited federal 
immigration enforcement by local law enforcement (similar functions already being performed by the 
Azle Police Department) providing trained Azle Police officers to initiate immigration detainers for 
certain offenders. The program provides federal reimbursement of costs associated with this type of 
enforcement, quarterly funding for participating officers, and up to $100,000 in equipment funding upon 
completion of officer training. 
 
Jim Kirk 116 Westlake Woods Dr - addressed the council regarding his concerns about this program 
and asked the council to deny the resolution.  
 
 
Councilmember Derrick Nelson moved to approve Resolution 2026-04 authorizing the City's 
participation in the U.S. Immigration and Customs Enforcement (ICE) 287(g) Task Force Model 
Program and authorizing the City Manager to execute the memorandum of agreement (MOA) and all 
necessary documents, as presented. Councilmember Rouel Rothenberger seconded the motion.  
Yes: (6) Randa Goode, Stacy Peek, Derrick Nelson, Amy Estes, Josh Berry, Rouel Rothenberger  
No: (1) Brian Conner 

6. Consider any action on the Facade and Signage Improvement Program application for 1413 
Southeast Parkway. 

 
Mayor Goode recognized Community and Marketing Specialist Kristen Pegues, who presented the 
façade grant request. She noted the request met all program requirements, and Staff recommended 
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approval by the Council. 

Councilmember Rothenberger moved to approve the Facade and Signage Improvement Program 
application for 1413 Southeast Parkway in the amount of $10,000. Councilmember Conner seconded 
the motion. 
Yes: (7) Randa Goode, Stacy Peek, Derrick Nelson, Amy Estes, Josh Berry, Rouel 

Rothenberger, Brian Conner

7. Consider any action on Ordinance No. 2026-06, declaring each unopposed candidate in the May
2, 2026, General Election elected to office and canceling the General Election
Mayor Goode recognized City Secretary Yael Hoffman, who noted the candidates for Places 1, 2, and 5 
are unopposed. Therefore, Council may cancel the general election for those offices. The special
election will take place as scheduled.

Councilmember Estes moved to approve Ordinance No. 2026-06, declaring each unopposed candidate 
in the May 2, 2026, General Election elected to office and canceling the General Election. 
Councilmember Berry seconded the motion. 
Yes: (7) Randa Goode, Stacy Peek, Derrick Nelson, Amy Estes, Josh Berry, Rouel 

Rothenberger, Brian Conner

8. Consider any action on acceptance of the auditor's opinion and the Annual Comprehensive
Financial Report for the fiscal year ended September 30, 2025.
Mayor Goode recognized Mike Brooks from BrooksWatson & Co, who gave a short presentation on the 
City’s financial audit and the Annual Comprehensive Financial Report, noting the City is in a healthy 
financial position. Mr Brooks stated the Finance Department did an excellent job.

Councilmember Rothenberger moved to accept the auditor's opinion and the Annual Comprehensive 
Financial Report for the fiscal year ended September 30, 2025, as presented. Councilmember Berry 
seconded the motion. 
Yes: (7) Randa Goode, Stacy Peek, Derrick Nelson, Amy Estes, Josh Berry, Rouel 

Rothenberger, Brian Conner

9. Consider any action on Ordinance No. 2026-04 regarding the adoption of the 2024 International
Building Codes and the 2023 National Electrical Code with North Central Texas Council of
Governments (NCTCOG) amendments.
Mayor Goode recognized David Hawkins, Director of Planning and Development, who reported the City 
currently operates under the 2018 International Codes and the 2017 National Electrical Code, with 
North Central Texas Council of Governments (NCTCOG) amendments. Staff proposed that Council 
adopt the 2024 International Codes and 2023 National Electrical Code, along with the recommended 
NCTCOG amendments, with a 60-day grace period for implementation. The Building Board of Appeals 
reviewed the proposed updates on January 26, 2026, and recommended approval by a 4-0 vote, as 
presented. Discussion was held on changes to permit requirements for accessory buildings 120 square 
feet or smaller, erosion control enforcement and fees, and naming of the department within the 
Administrative section of each building code.

Councilmember Derrick Nelson moved to approve Ordinance No. 2026-04 regarding the adoption of 
the 2024 International Building Codes and the 2023 National Electrical Code with North Central Texas 
Council of Governments (NCTCOG) amendments as presented with the following changes:

• Section 103.1 of the Administration section for each Building Code to be revised to remove the 
"creation" of the enforcement agency, renaming the department to "Planning and 
Development", and adding to the official in charge "or his/her designee" for delegation of 
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authority.  Councilmember Amy Estes seconded the motion. 

Yes: (6) Stacy Peek, Derrick Nelson, Amy Estes, Josh Berry, Rouel Rothenberger, Brian Conner  
No: (1) Randa Goode 

10. Consider any action on Ordinance No. 2026-05 regarding the adoption of the 2024 International
Fire Code with North Central Texas Council of Governments (NCTCOG) amendments.
Mayor Goode recognized Fire Chief Scott, who explained that the City currently operates under the 
2018 International Fire Code (IFC) with North Central Texas Council of Governments (NCTCOG) 
amendments adopted in 2019. Staff proposed that Council adopt the 2024 IFC along with the 
recommended NCTCOG amendments, with a 60-day grace period for implementation. The Building 
Board of Appeals reviewed the proposed updates on January 26, 2026, and recommended approval by 
a 4-0 vote, as presented.  Discussion was held on the minimum building size requirement for a fire 
sprinkler system and fire sprinkler requirements for adding an attached garage to a house.

Councilmember Conner moved to approve Ordinance No. 2026-05 regarding the adoption of the 2024 
International Fire Code with North Central Texas Council of Governments (NCTCOG) amendments, as 
presented. Councilmember Rothenberger seconded the motion. 
Yes: (7) Randa Goode, Stacy Peek, Derrick Nelson, Amy Estes, Josh Berry, Rouel 

Rothenberger, Brian Conner

ITEMS TO BE PLACED ON FUTURE MEETING AGENDAS  
Sex Offender Ordinance. 

MAYOR/COUNCIL COMMENTS OF COMMUNITY INTEREST   

• 03-05-2025 Employee Appreciation Banquet
• 03-12-2025 Showcase at Azle ISD
• 03-13-2026 Coffee with First Responders at Servolution Dream Center
• 03-13-2026 CWD Driver Appreciation Luncheon at Red's Burgers
• 03/16 - 20/2026 Spring break activities at Azle Library

EXECUTIVE SESSION  
Mayor Goode convened to Executive Session at 8:14 PM. 
Mayor Goode reconvened to open meeting at 9:08 PM. 

551.071 CONSULTATION WITH THE CITY ATTORNEY 
The City Council may conduct a private consultation with its attorney when the City Council 
seeks the advice of its attorney concerning any item on this agenda, about pending and 
contemplated litigation, or a settlement offer, or on a matter in which the duty of the attorney to 
the City Council under the Texas Disciplinary Rules of Professional Conduct of the State Board 
of Texas clearly conflicts with Chapter 551. 

• U.S Realty 87 Azle Associates, LP vs. City of Azle
• City of Reno`s attempt to annex property within the Extraterritorial Jurisdiction (ETJ) of

the City of Azle.

551.074 PERSONNEL MATTERS 

• Deliberate the appointment, employment, evaluation, reassignment, duties, discipline, or
dismissal of City Manager.
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11. Take any action pursuant to Executive Session.

No action was taken.

ADJOURNMENT    
Mayor Goode adjourned at 9:09 PM. 

Presented and approved on 03-17-2026. 

__________________ 
Randa Goode, Mayor 

Attest: 

______________________ 
Yael Hoffman, TRMC, MMC 
City Secretary 
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Item Number: 3  

  

Presenter: Jennifer Walls, Purchasing Agent 
Agenda Item: Consider any action awarding the bid for the City's annual requirement of 

Process Chemicals (Bid No. 2026-002) 

 
Background and Explanation: 
On February 26, 2026, sealed bids were opened and read aloud for chemicals used at the Water and 
Wastewater Treatment Plants. Thirteen (13) different chemicals are used to maintain consistent 
water quality at the Water Plant and to ensure the sewage is safe for discharge at the Wastewater 
Treatment Plant. The bid specifications stated a primary and secondary vendor for each chemical 
would be awarded to ensure product availability for the plants. 
 
As shown on the attached bid tabulation, fifteen (15) bidders responded with ten (10) of those 
agreeing to serve as a secondary vendor. The bid representing the best value to the City for each 
chemical is highlighted with primary and secondary vendors as indicated.  
 
Staff notes that one vendor submitted a bid but did not acknowledge receipt of the addendum issued 
during the solicitation period. Since acknowledgment of all addenda is required for a bid to be 
considered a responsive bid, the vendor's submission is deemed non-responsive and cannot be 
considered for award.   
 
All bids were evaluated by the Water Department and Purchasing Staff, who determined the City 
received qualifying bids for each individual chemical. 
  
Board/Commission/Committee Recommendation: 
N/A. 
  
Staff Recommendation: 
Staff recommends awarding the bid to the highlighted primary and secondary bidders for the 
respective chemicals on the attached bid tabulation.  Staff also recommends purchasing Calcium 
Hypochlorite (HTH) and Hydrofluorosilicic Acid on an as-needed basis since no responses were 
received and due to the small quantity typically purchased.  
  
Attachments: 
1. 2026 Process Chemicals Bid Tab 
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Trade Name Water Trade Name Waste W

Baker Services YES 0.1492

Brenntag NO 0.9380 0.1590

Carbon Activated Corporation YES 1.3000

Catalynt YES 0.1100 0.9000 0.2200

Chameleon Industries YES 0.1150 0.1390

Chemtrade YES 0.1362 0.1500

Pennco NO 0.1295 0.2380

PVS DX NO 0.1275 0.2049

PVS Technologies YES 0.2300

Shannon Chemical Corporation NO 2.8300

SNF Polydyne YES C-6266 1.7600

Univar Solutions YES 0.1280 3.4700 2.6600 1.3000 0.1191 0.2131

US Alco YES 0.1520 GC8781 0.4870

Vineera YES 0.1380 0.2060

Lowest Qualifying Bid 0.1100 0.1295 No Bid 0.9000 0.2300 0.4870 1.7600 2.8300 1.3000 0.1275 0.1590 No Bid

2021 2022 2023 2024 2025 2026 Change % Change
PVS DX 1.2445 Alum 0.0755 0.1170 0.0935 0.1030 0.1010 0.1100 0.0090 8.18%

LAS 0.0985 0.1870 0.1800 0.1450 0.1245 0.1295 0.0050 3.86%
*All prices are bid in wet / pounds for Solutions HTH 2.2500 2.1900 2.6500 3.5800 2.8500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
all dry weight / pounds for Dry chemicals Copper Sulfate 1.1900 1.1900 0.7020 1.6700 0.0000 0.9000 0.9000 100.00%

Ferric Chloride 0.1362 0.1579 0.2349 0.2450 0.2380 0.2300 -0.0080 -3.48%
Notes Polymer - W 0.3040 0.4240 0.4375 0.4375 0.4570 0.4870 0.0300 6.16%

Polymer - WW 1.2600 1.6000 1.7400 1.7400 1.7600 1.7600 0.0000 0.00%
Potassium Perm. 1.8300 3.3200 3.9900 3.2900 2.4000 2.8300 0.4300 15.19%
Activated Carbon 1.2100 1.2800 1.2500 1.2900 1.2700 1.3000 0.0300 2.31%

25% Caustic 0.0700 0.1250 0.1506 0.1197 0.1217 0.1275 0.0058 4.55%
50% Caustic 0.1263 0.2313 0.2690 0.2124 0.2080 0.1590 -0.0490 -30.82%

Fluoride - 55 gal 0.4750 0.5700 0.5500 0.5800 0.5300 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cl2 0.5125 0.8875 1.1745 1.1945 1.2445 1.2445 0.0000 0.00%

Secondary Vendor

Secondary 
Vendor

*See Notes
Chlorine ( 1 Ton Cylinder ) Bid Rejected

Sole / Winning Bid

Univar Solutions failed to provide an acknowledgment of Addendum with their bid 
submission. Failure to do so has rendered their bid Null and Void.

There were no qualifying bids for (HTH) Calcium Hypochlorite or Hydrofluorosilicic Acid. 
Due to the small amounts used in the treatment process these chemicals shall be 
purchased on an as needed basis

City of Azle 
2026 Bulk Chemical Bids*    -    BID # 2026-002

Opened 02/26/2026 at 14:01
Sodium Hydroxide                         

25%    /    50%Vendor Ferric 
Chloride

Ammonium 
Sulfate (LAS)

Potassium 
Perm.

PolymersAluminum 
Sulfate (Alum)

Calcium 
Hypochlorite 

(HTH) 

Hydrofluorosilicic 
Acid 55 gal.

Copper 
Sulfate

Activated 
Carbon
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Item Number: 4  

  

Presenter: Kristen Pegues, Community & Marketing Specialist 
Agenda Item: Consider any action on the Facade and Signage Improvement Program 

application for 1129 - 1137 SE Pkwy 

 
Background and Explanation: 
This request is related to a previously approved grant for the same shopping center. Because the 
center has three (3) separate property owners, only one portion of the parking lot was repaved during 
the initial project. The owner of the middle section is requesting funding to repave his portion of the 
parking lot so it matches the recently improved area. The requested grant amount is $975.00. 
 
Property Aerial: 

  
Board/Commission/Committee Recommendation: 
 

Staff Recommendation: 
Staff recommends approval. 

Attachments: 
1. FSIP Application - 1129-1137 SE Pkwy 
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Item Number: 5  

  

Presenter: David Hawkins, Director of Planning and Development 
Agenda Item: Consider a petition for release from the City's Extraterritorial Jurisdiction 

(ETJ) for property legally described as a 6.88-acre tract of land situated in 
the Sarah Ann Dodson Survey, Abstract No. 363, Parker County, Texas, 
being described as 1.0 acres identified as Property ID R000039654 and 
Geographic ID 20363.008.000.00 and 5.88 acres identified as Property ID 
R000097501 and Geographic ID 20363.007.003.00 in the records of Parker 
County, Texas, a portion of all of that tract of land described by deed to 
Weatherby Business Park II, LLC, recorded in Document No. 202533599, 
County Records, Parker County, Texas and addressed as 13103 S FM 730. 

 
Background and Explanation: 
The 2023 Texas State Legislative session passed a new Senate Bill (SB 2038), which permits 
residents and property owners to submit a petition to be released from a City's Extraterritorial 
Jurisdiction (ETJ), effective September 1, 2023. A petition that meets all requirements of SB 2038 
and the Texas Election Code must be approved for ETJ release by the City. The City Council 
approved an ordinance (Ord. No. 2023-23) on November 7, 2023, which adopted procedures and 
established a fee for processing any future petitions and verifying compliance with State statutes. 
 
This is the fourth official request for release from the City's ETJ since the adoption of the ETJ 
Release ordinance. This request is for a 6.88-acre tract of land located on the north side of S FM 730 
and south side of Greg Street approximately 500 feet north of Winding Way within Parker County. 
The properties currently have one single-family residence and several supporting structures on site.  
 
Property Location: 
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Board/Commission/Committee Recommendation: 
N/A. 
  
Staff Recommendation: 
This ETJ Release request meets the requirements of SB 2038 and the City's ordinance. Staff 
forwards this request to the City Council for approval. 

Attachments: 
1. Petition for Release of Area from ETJ - 13103 S FM 730 
 
 

Page 30 of 56



��������	
��
�����	��������
����������������������������������� !"#�!$%&'()$*+,�-./0�/11�2345�678�#59335:�#;<53�=11�>?95�2?95@:��3AB4��6=-10�CD-6E�FF0GF0H/�>IJ�CD-6E�D66GH6D-��

�
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Item Number: 6  

  

Presenter: Ben Hall, Police Chief 
Agenda Item: Consider any action on Ordinance No. 2026-07 Sex Offender Residency 

Restrictions, to prohibit certain registered sex offenders from residing 
within a certain distance of where children commonly gather 

 
Background and Explanation: 
Registered sex offenders can be restricted by a city ordinance from living near Child Safety Zones 
within a municipality. Child Safety Zones are generally defined as places where children congregate, 
including schools, licensed daycare facilities, youth centers, parks, public or semi-public pools, and 
playgrounds. Churches with playgrounds or youth programs may also be included as a Child Safety 
Zone. The ordinance identifies such places and is used to create a map showing a one-thousand-
foot exclusion zone around the property lines of sites which qualify for inclusion in Child Safety 
Zones. A map depicting the prohibited areas shall be created by the City and maintained by the Azle 
Police Department.  
 
The ordinance can also restrict a register sex offender from going in or on any real property within 
1,000 feet of a child safety zone, having an outdoor light illuminated inviting trick-or-treaters to solicit 
the premises or to hand out candy or other items on Halloween, and loitering knowingly or 
intentionally within 300 feet of a child safety zone. 

Board/Commission/Committee Recommendation: 
N/A. 
  
Staff Recommendation: 
With the recent passage of a similar ordinance in Ft Worth, a major population center, our city will 
likely see an increase in Registered Sex Offenders looking for residency where these restrictions 
don't exist.  Enacting this ordinance should help us maintain a better level of control over where 
Registered Sex Offenders live in an effort to lessen the likelihood of interaction with children and 
protect children from potential predatory behavior. 

Attachments: 
1. Ord. 2026-07 
2. Protected Properties 1,000 foot buffer zones 
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ORDINANCE NO. 2026-07 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF AZLE, TEXAS, ADDING A NEW 
ARTICLE 8.08, “SEX OFFENDER RESIDENCY RESTRICTIONS,” TO 
CHAPTER 8, “OFFENSES AND NUISANCES,” OF THE CODE OF 
ORDINANCES, CITY AZLE, TEXAS TO PROHIBIT CERTAIN 
REGISTERED SEX OFFENDERS FROM RESIDING WITHIN A 
CERTAIN DISTANCE OF WHERE CHILDREN COMMONLY GATHER; 
PROVIDING THAT THIS ORDINANCE SHALL BE CUMULATIVE OF 
ALL ORDINANCES; PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; 
PROVIDING FOR A PENALTY FOR VIOLATIONS HEREOF; 
PROVIDING A SAVINGS CLAUSE; PROVIDING FOR PUBLICATION IN 
THE OFFICIAL NEWSPAPER; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE 
DATE. 

  
WHEREAS, the City of Azle, Texas (the “City”), is a home rule city acting under its 

charter adopted by the electorate pursuant to Article XI, Section 5 of the Texas Constitution and 
Chapter 9 of the Local Government Code; and 

 
WHEREAS, the City Council endeavors to protect the health, safety, and general welfare 

of the public from the negative impacts associated with child sex offenders; and 
 
WHEREAS, the City finds that the protection of children is paramount to creating a safe 

environment in which to live, work, and play in our community; and 
 
WHEREAS, the City Council finds and determines that child sex offenders who are 

required to register within the Texas State Sex Offender Registry represent a serious threat to 
public safety; and 
 

WHEREAS, the City Council finds and determines that the recidivism rate for released 
sex offenders is alarmingly high, especially for those who commit their crimes against children; 
and 
 

WHEREAS, the City Council finds and determines that persons convicted of offenses that 
involve either physical contact with minors or preparatory steps towards physical contact with 
minors are a greater risk to the safety of children who gather near areas where such offenders 
reside; and 
 

WHEREAS, it is the determination of the City Council that every effort should be made 
to protect its citizens from harm at the hands of certain sex offenders, and that the City's children 
are worthy of protection to the greatest extent afforded under the law; and 
 

WHEREAS, the City Council finds and determines that the City has a legitimate interest 
in the protection of children and that the following restrictions are enacted to provide further 
protection for children in the City by minimizing sex offenders’ access and proximity to areas 
where children gather; and 
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WHEREAS, the City Council finds and determines that it has a compelling interest to 
promote, protect, and improve the health, safety, and general welfare of the citizens of the City by 
creating areas around locations where children regularly congregate or may congregate in 
concentrated numbers wherein certain registered sex offenders are prohibited from establishing 
temporary or permanent residency; and 
 

WHEREAS, the provisions of this Ordinance do not prohibit registered sex offenders from 
residing in the City; and 

 
WHEREAS, it is not the intent of the City Council to impose a criminal penalty, but rather 

to serve the City’s interest in protecting the health, safety, and welfare of the public by prohibiting 
convicted child sexual offenders from residing in specified areas near locations where children 
commonly gather; and 
 

WHEREAS, the City finds that the adoption and enforcement of this Ordinance will help 
foster a partnership with the community by protecting the family and maintaining the City as a 
place to live, visit, and conduct business; and 
 

WHEREAS, in considering this Ordinance, the City Council relies on the entirety of its 
experiences and knowledge; and 

 
 WHEREAS, the City Council finds and determines the provisions of this Ordinance are 
necessary to protect the public, health, safety, and general welfare of City citizens and the public; 
and 
 

WHEREAS, the City Council is authorized by law to adopt the provisions contained 
herein, and has complied with all the prerequisites necessary for the passage of this Ordinance, 
including but not limited to the Open Meetings Act. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF AZLE, TEXAS, THAT:  

 
 

SECTION 1. 
 

The Code of Ordinances, City of Azle, Texas is hereby amended by adding Article 8.08, 
“Sex Offender Residency Restrictions,” to Chapter 8, “Offenses and Nuisances,” to read as 
follows: 

 
“ARTICLE 8.08 SEX OFFENDER RESIDENCY RESTRICTIONS 
 
Sec. 8.08.001 Findings incorporated. 

The findings set forth in this Ordinance are incorporated into the body of this Article as if 
fully set forth herein. 
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Sec. 8.08.002 Definitions.  

 For the purpose of this Article, the following terms, words, and the derivations thereof shall 
have the meaning given herein: 

Child, children, or minor(s) shall mean any person under the age of seventeen (17). 

Child-care institution shall mean a commercial day care center that provides regular care 
to any number of adults or children for less than twenty-four (24) hours a day.  

Child safety zone means the premises where children commonly gather. The term includes 
a school, day-care facility, playground, public or private youth center, public swimming pool, 
video arcade facility, or other facility that regularly holds events primarily for children.  A church, 
as defined by Section 544.251 of the Texas Insurance Code, can be a premise where children 
commonly gather. 

Database means the Texas Department of Public Safety's Sex Offender Database pursuant 
to the Sex Offender Registration and Notification Act, Texas Code of Criminal Procedure, Chapter 
62, or the sex offender registration files maintained by the sex offender registration officer of the 
police department. 

Day-care facility shall mean a facility licensed, certified, or registered by the Texas 
Department of Family and Protective Services to provide assessment, care, training, education, 
custody, treatment, or supervision for a child who is not related by blood, marriage, or adoption to 
the owner or operator of the facility, for all or part of the 24-hour day, whether or not the facility 
is operated for profit or charges for the services it offers. 

Halloween shall mean the activity of children going door to door to collect candy or other 
items to celebrate the holiday typically observed on or about October 31st. 

Loitering shall mean walking about aimlessly without apparent purpose; lingering; hanging 
around; lagging behind the idle spending of time; delaying, sauntering, and moving slowly about, 
where such conduct is not due to physical defects or conditions.  

Playground, premise, school, video arcade facility, and youth center shall have the 
meanings assigned by Section 481.134 of the Texas Health and Safety Code.   

Permanent residence means a place where a person abides, lodges, or resides for fourteen 
(14) or more consecutive days. 

Places where children regularly congregate shall have the same meaning as child safety 
zone.  

Registered sex offender shall mean an individual who is required to register as a sex 
offender under Chapter 62, Code of Criminal Procedure. 
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School means a private or public preschool, private or public elementary school, or private 
or public secondary school. 

Temporary residence shall mean either a place where a person abides, lodges, or resides 
for a period of fourteen (14) or more days in the aggregate during any calendar year, and is not the 
person's permanent address, or a place where a person routinely abides, lodges, or resides for a 
period of four (4) or more consecutive or non-consecutive days in any month and which is not the 
person's permanent address. 

Sec. 8.08.003 Offenses. 

(a) It is an offense for a registered sex offender to establish either a permanent 
residence, temporary residence, or both within one thousand (1,000) feet of the real 
property comprising a child safety zone. 
 

(b) It is an offense for a registered sex offender to go in or on any real property within 
one thousand (1,000) feet of a child safety zone.  
 

(c) It is an offense for a registered sex offender to have an outdoor light illuminated, to 
invite trick-or-treaters to solicit the premises, or to hand out candy or other items 
on Halloween, observed on or about October 31st.  
 

(d) It is an offense for a registered sex offender to knowingly or intentionally loiter 
within three hundred (300) feet of a child safety zone. 
 

(e) This section applies to all registered sex offenders, as defined by this Article, 
regardless of the individual’s reported risk level or whether the individual has been 
assigned a reported risk level. 
 

(f) It is unlawful to let or rent any place, structure or part thereof, manufactured home, 
trailer, or any other conveyance, with the knowledge that it will be used as a 
permanent residence or temporary residence by any person prohibited from 
establishing such permanent residence or temporary residence pursuant to the terms 
of this Article, if such place, structure, or part thereof, manufactured home, trailer, 
or other conveyance is located within one thousand (1,000) feet of a child safety 
zone. 

 
Sec. 8.08.004 City notification required. 
 

At least seven (7) days prior to establishing permanent or temporary residence in the City, 
a registered sex offender shall notify the Azle Police Department in writing and provide the 
following information: 
 

(a) the name and contact information of the registered sex offender; and 
 

(b) the address of the residence to which the person intends to move. 
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Sec. 8.08.005 Evidentiary matters; measurement. 

(a) It shall be prima facie evidence that this Article applies to a person, if that person's 
record appears on the database and the database indicates that the victim was less 
than seventeen (17) years of age. 

 
(b) Except for loitering, neither allegation nor evidence of a culpable mental state is 

required for proof of an offense defined by this chapter.  
 

(c) For the purpose of determining the minimum distance of separation, the 
requirements shall be measured by following a straight line from the outer property 
line of the permanent residence or temporary residence to the nearest property line 
of the child safety zone, or, in the case of multiple residences on one property, 
measuring from the nearest property line of the premises to the nearest property 
line of the child safety zone. 

 
(d) A map depicting the prohibited areas shall be created by the City and maintained 

by the Azle Police Department. The City shall review the map annually for changes. 
Said map will be available to the public for viewing at the Azle Police Department 
and on the City’s official website. 

 
(e) In cases of a dispute over measured distances, it shall be incumbent upon the 

person(s) challenging the measurement to prove otherwise 
 
Sec. 8.08.006 Affirmative defenses. 

 
(a) The following are affirmative defenses to this Article for a person required to 

register as a sex offender pursuant to Chapter 62, Code of Criminal Procedure: 
 

(1) The person established the permanent residence or temporary residence 
within one thousand (1,000) feet of a child safety zone and has complied 
with all of the sex offender registration laws of the state before the date of 
the adoption of this Article; 

 
(2) The person was a minor when he or she committed the offense requiring 

such registration and was not convicted as an adult; 
 
(3) The person is a minor, as defined by Texas Penal Code or a ward under a 

guardianship, who resides with a parent or guardian; 
 
(4) The person has been exempted by a court order from registration as a sex 

offender under Chapter 62, Texas Code of Criminal Procedure; 
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(5) The offense for which the sex offender registration was required was 
reversed on appeal or pardoned; 

 
(6) The person's duty to register on/in the database has expired; 

 
(7) The premises where children regularly congregate, as specified herein, 

within one thousand (1,000) feet of the permanent residence or temporary 
residence was established after the person established the permanent 
residence or temporary residence and the person has complied with all sex 
offender registration laws of the state; or 

 
(8) The information on the database is incorrect, and, if corrected, this Article 

would not apply to the person who was incorrectly or improperly listed on 
the database. 

 
(9) Nothing in this provision shall require any person to sell or otherwise 

dispose of any real estate or home acquired or owned prior to the conviction 
of the person as a sex offender. 

 
(b)  It is an affirmative defense to prosecution if the person required to register as a sex 

offender under Chapter 62, Code of Criminal Procedure was in, on, or within a 
child safety zone for a legitimate purpose to include: 

 
(1) Transportation of a child the person is legally permitted to be with; 
(2) Transportation to and from work; or 
(3) Other work-related purposes. 

 
Sec. 8.08.007 Exemptions. 

(a) A person required to register as a sex offender under Chapter 62, Code of Criminal 
Procedure is exempt from this Article if permanent or temporary residency was 
established prior to the date this Article was adopted. This exemption shall only 
apply to:  

 
(1) Areas necessary for the registered sex offender to have access to and live in 

the residence;  
 

(2) The period the registered sex offender maintains residency in the residence. 
  

Sec. 8.08.008 Appeal procedure. 
 

(a) A registered sex offender subject to the provisions of this Article may appeal the 
applicability of one or more of the provisions herein as follows:  

(1) The individual appealing the applicability of any provision in this Article 
must present a written and notarized letter of appeal to the City Secretary.  
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The letter of appeal is not required to contain any information considered 
confidential by law. The letter shall, at minimum, include the following: 
 

a. Person’s name and contact information; 
 

b. Description of the basis of the appeal, including the citation of the 
specific section of the Article being appealed; 
 

c. All supporting documentation necessary to make a final 
determination; and 
 

d. Other information as reasonably required.  
 

(2) Upon receipt of a completed letter of appeal, the City Secretary will forward 
the appeal to the City Manager’s Office and the Chief of Police. The City 
Manager, in coordination with the Mayor, shall schedule a public hearing 
on the appeal to be held at either a regular or special meeting of the City 
Council within thirty (30) days of receipt of the appeal. 
 

(3) The City Council or the applicant may request an extension of the hearing 
deadline, but in no event shall a public hearing on the appeal be heard more 
than ninety (90) days after the letter of appeal is received. 

 
(4) The City Council may hear and review any information relevant to the 

appeal, including oral or written statements from any person with 
information relevant to the appeal.  

 
(5) Upon conclusion of the public hearing, the City Council shall render a 

decision on the appeal, in whole or in part, by a majority vote of the entire 
council.  The decision of the City Council shall be final.  
 

(6) The City Secretary shall provide the appellant written notice of the final 
decision by the City Council within thirty (30) days.   
 

(7) A written copy of the official minutes of the meeting shall serve as the 
record of appeal and be retained in the City’s files in conformance with 
record retention policies.  

(b) Examples of special circumstances in support of an appeal may include, but are not 
limited to, staying with family due to medical problems, natural disasters, or court-
ordered housing assignment. 

 

Sec. 8.08.009 Penalty. 

Any person, firm, corporation, agent, or employee thereof who violates any of the 
provisions of this Article shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and upon conviction thereof shall be 
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fined for each offense as provided in Section 1.01.009 of the Code of Ordinances, City of Azle, 
Texas. Each day that a violation is permitted to exist shall constitute a separate offense. 
 
Secs. 8.08.010 – 8.08.020 Reserved.” 
 
 

SECTION 2. 
 

This Ordinance shall be cumulative of all provisions of ordinances and of the Code of 
Ordinances, City of Azle, Texas, as amended, except where the provisions are in direct conflict 
with the provisions of other ordinances, in which event the conflicting provisions of the other 
ordinances are hereby repealed. 
 
 

SECTION 3. 
 

It is hereby declared to be the intention of the City Council that the phrases, clauses, 
sentences, paragraphs, and sections of this Ordinance are severable, and if any phrase, clause, 
sentence, paragraph, or section of this Ordinance shall be declared unconstitutional by the valid 
judgment or decree of any court of competent jurisdiction, such unconstitutionality shall not affect 
any of the remaining phrases, clauses, sentences, paragraphs, and sections of this Ordinance, since 
the same would have been enacted by the City Council without the incorporation in this Ordinance 
of any such unconstitutional phrase, clause, sentence, paragraph, or section. 

 
 

SECTION 4. 
 

Any person, firm or corporation who violates, disobeys, omits, neglects, refuses, or fails to 
comply with, or who resists the enforcement of any provision of this Ordinance shall be fined in 
accordance with Section 1.01.009 of the Code of Ordinances, City of Azle, Texas for each offence. 
Each day that a violation is permitted to exist shall constitute a separate offense.  

 
 

SECTION 5. 
 

All rights and remedies of the City are expressly saved as to any and all violations of the 
provisions of the Code of Ordinances, Azle, Texas, as amended, which have accrued at the time 
of the effective date of this Ordinance; and, as such accrued violations and all pending litigation, 
both civil and criminal, whether pending in court or not, under such ordinances, shall not be 
affected by this Ordinance, but may be prosecuted until final disposition by the court. 
 
 

SECTION 6. 
 
 The City Secretary of the City is hereby directed to publish the caption, penalty clause, and 
effective date clause in the official newspaper as required by the City Charter. 
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SECTION 7. 

 
This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect after its passage and publication as required 

by law and the City Charter, and it is so ordained.  
 

 
 
 
PASSED AND APPROVED ON THIS 17th DAY OF MARCH 2026. 

 
 

  
___________________________________ 
Randa Goode, Mayor 

 
ATTEST: 

 
 
___________________________________ 
Yael Hoffman, City Secretary 
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Item Number: 7  

  

Presenter: 
 

Agenda Item: Consider any action pursuant to Executive Session.  

 
Background and Explanation: 
 

Board/Commission/Committee Recommendation: 
 

Staff Recommendation: 
 

Attachments: 
None 
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